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THE FUTURE OF FITTERS

been told by our contacts within CMS 
and Medicare that until they tell us 
something different, everything we’re 
doing right now with accrediting 
businesses staffed by certified orthotic 
fitters is fine…. Nothing has changed.”

Fletcher says there continues to be 
demand for therapeutic shoe fitters 
given the high incidence of diabetes in 
the United States. He also sees a con-
tinuing role for orthotic fitters in O&P 
practices; it’s a need that is driven by 
reimbursements and cost effectiveness. 
“If your practice provides a large per-
cent of prefabricated orthotic devices...
it makes economic sense to have a 
certified or licensed orthotic fitter do 
that work rather than have a certified 
or licensed orthotist do that work. 
The salary for the orthotic fitter is less 
than the orthotist, and the reimburse-
ment is fixed no matter who provides 
the service. It is often not a highly 
complex clinical situation and is fairly 
straightforward. In those instances, an 
orthotic fitter is specifically educated, 
trained, and tested to provide those 
items and services.”

Kuffel concurs that the fitter versus 
clinician scenario Fletcher mentions  
is about dollars and sense. “It’s the  
lowest common denominator. If a 
patient comes in for a pair of shoes 
or therapeutic inserts why is a certi-
fied orthotist/prosthetist seeing that 
instead of a [therapeutic shoe or 
orthotic] fitter? That’s a bad allocation 
of talent at that point. So I think there 
is still an avenue for certified fitters in 
practice,” Kuffel says. 

Rob Sobel, CPed, president of PFA, 
questions whether therapeutic shoe  
fitters belong in O&P rather than in 
durable medical equipment (DME) 
because, from his perspective, they 
may often work for pharmacies and 
DME companies. He says that thera-
peutic shoe fitters comprise 4 to 5 
percent of PFA’s membership.

While he is unsure about the future 
of therapeutic shoe fitters, Sobel does 
know it’s a tough way to make a living. 
“I know that the reimbursements on 

the therapeutic shoes for diabetics 
is not great.” He’s heard from many 
pedorthists who want to discontinue 
fitting and providing therapeutic shoes 
due to the low reimbursements, exten-
sive paperwork, and audit nightmares 
they’ve encountered. “We would love 
to see [therapeutic shoe fitters] become 
pedorthists because at least that way 
it increases their scope of practice. To 
me, that’s their best shot at a future in 
O&P.”

AABCP sees a positive and growing 
future for post-mastectomy services, 
including a return to mastectomy care 
by O&P practices, despite the difficult 
reimbursement climate and subopti-
mal reimbursement rate, says the orga-
nization’s executive director Rhonda 
F. Turner, PhD, JD. “Mastectomy is 
a hybrid of both medically necessary 
services and retail products and has 
been for several decades. While many 
mastectomy fitters are struggling with 
documentation requirements, they 
have a firm and successful handle  
on the retail component of medical 
services. Additionally, there are state 
and federal mandates that require 
reimbursement of mastectomy prod-
ucts.” She says, too, that with only a 

handful of products and reimburse-
ment codes, knowledge and compli-
ance is manageable.

One of the issues AABCP addresses 
for mastectomy fitters is that of 
adequate education, she says. “The 
key component of mastectomy fitting 
is anatomical restoration; a return to 
symmetry,” Turner explains. “If not 
done properly, there are physiological 
consequences. The other component of 
mastectomy fitter that is overlooked is 
that these women and men are breast 
cancer survivors. Mastectomy fitters 
in every appointment are required to 
marry these two types of knowledge to 
properly fit a patient.” 

Kuffel asserts that despite the fitter 
education changes within NCOPE the 
profession will continue. “We want to 
still have some level of certification, 
but it’s not the level of a certified CPO 
who spent three years on a master’s 
degree and two years in residencies,” 
he says. “I think there is absolutely a 
venue for fitter education, I just don’t 
know if it’s underneath the guise of 
orthotics and prosthetics.” O&P EDGE

Laura Fonda Hochnadel can be reached at  
laura@opedge.com.

embraceable
For over 20-years, the Bremer Group 
Company has established a reputation  
for embracing practitioners and patients 
with high quality back braces and 
exceptional customer service.  
We provide comprehensive back 
brace solutions:

• VertAlign®, ComfAlign® or Custom 
Back Braces enveloping your patients with 
the support that fits their diagnosis; protects 
instability, helps to ease their pain

• Application and use training in your 
office plus printed patient instructions,  
encircling a successful fit, enhancing 
compliance  

• Support for proper reimbursement 
encompassing products with verified 
payment histories and extraordinary 
customer service  

Embrace Bremer Group back bracing 
without delay!  
Visit www.bremergroup.com,  
or call 800-428-2304.
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